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Product Description

Quality management thinking has influenced a revolution in the way organizations are managed over the past few
decades. Idea such as customer focus, ethical management, continuous improvement, Six sigma, leadership and
organizational learning have all been impacted by and in some cases developed from this important field. this
provides a coherent view of the underlying principles quality management, and how these relate to practical
application in a range of organizations. This book is designed to provide an overview of the key elements, important
historical context and current debates in the field of quality management. It aims to give a coherent view of the
underlying principles of quality management, and how these relate to practical application in a range of organization.
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Introduction of Information Security and security and cyber law covers the fundamentals aspect of system,
Information system, Distributed Information system, Cryptography, Network Security etc. It is Incredibly robust,
portable & adaptable. This book coverage of Model paper, Question Bank and Examination Question Paper etc.
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Each chapter of the book begins with introduction explaining the need of the contents discussed in the chapter,
Figures have been inserted at relevant places to help the reader to understand the concept clearly, Each chapter is
followed by the points that provide a helpful way to recap all the topics covered in a chapter, Exercise in the form of
Questions is added at the end of each chapter aimed at providing the in-depth understanding of the concepts
learned, The end of the book contained solved university asked questions.
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This text book is designed to meet the requirements of the students of postgraduate and undergraduate engineering
students of various branches. The book offers the concise coverage of the fundamentals of Database, Database
Structures, data Modeling, ER Diagram, Introduction on SQL, Database Design, MySQL, Oracle and Distributed
database etc. This book comprises of various realistic pictures in each of the chapter to give the real feel of the
subject to the reader for better understanding.
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This text book is designed to meet the requirements of the students of postgraduate and undergraduate engineering
students of various branches. The book offers the concise coverage of the computer network like Network Structure
and Architecture, different protocols, switching methods, network layer, Transport Layers, Application layers. This
book comprises of various realistic pictures in each of the chapter to give the real feel of the subject to the reader for
better understanding.
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